
JASON GALANTER
It  is with deep sorrow that we announce the passing of

Jason Galanter, age 57, on March 14, 2025. Jason was born
on December 22, 1967, to Janice and Larry Galanter. He was
a beloved husband,  father,  son,  brother and uncle,  whose
love and kindness will forever be cherished.

Jason  is  survived  by  his  loving  wife,  Lori  Galanter;  his
children, Jacob Galanter (Mev Howison), and Kira Galanter;
his  parents,  Janice  and  Larry  Galanter;  his  siblings,  Alexis
Galanter,  married to  Robert  Butcher  and Dan Galanter;  as
well  as  his  cherished niece  and  nephews,  Quinn  Butcher,
Cam Butcher and Chloe Butcher.

A devoted family man, Jason was known for his warmth,
humor and generosity. He dedicated his professional life to
the mastery  of  technology in  all  its  forms,  he held  senior
network  engineering  and  architecture  roles  at  several
technology firms, helping them to grow and scale globally to
serve  customers  all  over  the  world.  Notable  companies
include Airbnb and Linkedin. In the last two years, Jason was
Vice President of Enterprise Infrastructure and Engineering
at Stack AV, a company dedicated to deploying autonomous
trucks to streamline supply chains across the U.S. Jason will
forever  be  remembered  as  a  brilliant  architect,  engineer,
mentor  and  coach,  who  led  his  teams  with  integrity  and
passion. Jason enjoyed sharing his interests, whether it be
his love of good food, weekly trips to the shooting range or
watching  movies  with  those  closest  to  him.  Through  his
work, his friendships and his love for his family, Jason left a
lasting impact on everyone he met.

Graveside Services and Interment were held at Homewood
Cemetery, on Sunday, March 16, 2025.

In lieu of flowers, contributions may be made to Bridge to
Home Animal Rescue (bridgetohome84.org), an organization
close to Jason's heart.

Jason's memory will live on in the hearts of his family and
friends, who will forever remember him for the joy and love
he  brought  into  their  lives.   Arrangements  entrusted  to
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