
IN THE CIRCUIT COURT
OF MONONGALIA

COUNTY, WEST VIRGINIA
Division No. 2

IN THE INTEREST OF:
AUSHAMIER HICKMAN(M)

DOB: 03/20/2024 SSN: xxxx
CASE NO.: 24-JA-166

ADULT RESPONDENTS:
Kiana Wallace, biological

mother of the minor child,
Jerell Hickman, putative

biological father of the minor
child,

Unknown Father of the minor
child.

NOTICE TO ADULT
RESPONDENTS

UNKNOWN FATHER AND
JERELL HICKMAN

Upon information and belief,
the State of West Virginia was
unable  to  identify  the
biological father of minor child,
A.H.  (DOB  03/20/2024),  and
has identified Jerell  Hickman
as  the  putative  father  for
minor  child,  A.H.  (DOB
03/20/2024).  However,  any
person  purporting  to  have
parental  rights  to  the
above-named child is hereby
notified  that  a  hearing  is
scheduled for April 4, 2025,
at  10:00  a.m.  before  the
Honorable  Cindy  S.  Scott  at
the  Monongalia  County
Courthouse,  located  at  75
High  Street  3rd  Floor,
Morgantown, WV 26505. You
may appear at that time and
defend any such rights if you
choose to do so and that if
you choose not to participate
in  the  proceedings,  your
absence  may  affect  your
parental  and custodial  rights
to the child. Unknown Father
of A.H., your appointed legal
representation in this matter is
Andrew  Tyler  Reseter,  Esq.,
who  can  be  reached  at
724-963-4710. Jerell Hickman,
your  appointed  legal
representation in this matter is
John Brooks, Esq., who can be
reached at 304-599-5959.

/s/Samantha J. Elkins
Samantha J. Elkins (WVSB #

12238)
Assistant Prosecuting

Attorney
Monongalia County, WV

OFFICE OF THE
PROSECUTING ATTORNEY

Gabrielle Mucciola,
Prosecuting Attorney

Monongalia County Justice
Center

75 High Street, Ste. 11
Morgantown WV 26505
Phone: (304) 291-7250

Fax: (304) 291-7285


