
ADVERTISEMENT FOR
BIDS

Township of Findlay,
Allegheny County,

Pennsylvania
STORMWATER FACILITIES

LANDSCAPE
MAINTENANCE

FINDLAY  TOWNSHIP,
PENNSYLVANIA  Sealed bids
will be accepted at the Findlay
Township  Secretary’s  Office,
Township  Municipal  Building,
P.O.  Box W,  1271 Route  30,
Clinton, PA 15026 until 10:00
a.m., Monday, February 24th,
2025,  for  landscape
maintenance  work  for  the
Township’s  stormwater
facilities.  All  bids  should  be
hand delivered to ensure they
are received by the deadline.
Bids will  be publicly  opened
and read aloud at 10:00 a.m.
on  the  day  the  bids  are
received (February 24, 2025).
All  bids received after  10:00
a.m. on February 24, 2025 will
be rejected. The work includes
mowing and trimming of 22
Township-owned  stormwater
facilities starting from April 15
through November 1 for 2025
and 2026. Bid documents may
be obtained at the office of the
Township  Secretary  with  a
payment  of  $20.00
non-refundable  fee  for  each
set.  Bid  documents  can  be
mailed  upon  receipt  of  an
additional  $15.00
non-refundable  fee  to  cover
shipping costs. Payment may
be made directly to or made
payable to Findlay Township in
the form of a check or money
order.  For  convenience,  the
bid documents may also be
emailed upon request for no
charge.   Bids  must  be
submitted  on  prescribed
forms furnished with the bid
documents. The bid proposal
must  be  accompanied  by  a
Bid  Bond,  with  an  original
Power of Attorney, a certified
check, or a cashier’s check in
the about of ten percent (10%)
of the bid proposal made in
favor  of  the  “Township  of
Findlay”. Facsimiles will not be
accepted  and  will  provide
cause for rejection of the bid.
State  prevailing  wage  rates
may  be  part  of  this
contract.   No  bidder  shall
withdraw his bid for a period
of  sixty  (60)  days  from  the
date of the bid opening. The
Township  Board  of
Supervisors reserves the right
to reject any and all bids, to
waive  informalities,  and  to
award  contracts  deemed  to
be in the best interest of the
Township.

Thomas C. Garrett,
Township Manager


