
Kennedy  Township  is
accepting Sealed Bids for the
following vehicle:
2009 Chevrolet Silverado 2500

HD 4x4
V8 6.0 L Gas Engine
Western 7 ½ ft Plow

113,400 Miles
This  vehicle  was  utilized  by
Public Works and is in need of
repairs. Tires, master cylinder,
steering  booster,  seats,  and
extensive body work. All bids
must be submitted in a sealed
envelope,  clearly  marked
‘Vehicle Bid’, and received by
January 17, 2025 at 3:00 p.m.
to  Greg  Clarke,  Township
Manager, at 340 Forest Grove
Road,  McKees  Rocks,  PA
15136. The highest responsive
bid received will be accepted,
and  the  seller  reserves  the
right  to  reject  any  and  all
bids. Can be viewed by appt
by  calling  Justin  at
412-444-6525.


