
Crown  Communication  LLC
(Crown Castle) is proposing to
modify existing antennas and
associated equipment on the
rooftop  of  an  existing
191-foot-tall  (overall  height)
building at the following site:
130  7th  Street,  Pittsburgh,
Allegheny County, PA 15222,
coordinates  N40°  26'  37.1"/
W80°  0'  2.7".  Crown
Communication  LLC  (Crown
Castle) invites comments from
any  interested  party  on  the
impact of the proposed action
on  any  districts,  sites,
buildings, structures or objects
significant in American history,
archaeology,  engineering  or
culture  that  are  listed  or
determined eligible for listing
in  the  National  Register  of
Historic Places and/or specific
reason  the  proposed  action
may have a significant impact
on the quality of the human
environment.  Specific
information  regarding  the
project  is  available  by
contacting Crown Castle c/o
Julia  Klima  at  Dynamic
Environmental Associates, Inc.
at 3850 Lake Street, Suite C,
Macon,  GA  31204  or
Sec106@dynamicenvironm
ental.com.  Comments must
be received by November, 9th
2024. Re: 22409063


