
IT:  The Bank of New York Mellon seeks a Senior VP,
Program & Project Mgmt in Pittsburgh, PA, to perform
end-to-end  project  mgmt  activities  such  as  project
reporting, project planning, issue/risk identification &
tracking,  scope  mgmt,  estimation,  internal  client
mgmt,  relationship  mgmt  &  other  project
documentation  prep  for  projects  of  high  complexity.
Remote work may be permitted w/in commutable dist
from worksite. REQS: Bach or equiv. & 10 yrs exp in:
Leading  programs/projects  as  per  scaled  Agile
methodology  &  dvlpng  detailed  project  plans  &
schedules  for  projects,  incl  goals,  risks,  budget
allocation,  &  prioritization  reviews  while  monitoring
project  results  for  significant  deviations.  Dvlpg  &
refining tchncl  & bus.  req’mts for  implementation of
complex, statistical, economical, mathematical models
in  tech  platform  solutions.  In  alt,  Emp  will  accept
Master’s  &  8  yrs  exp.  Qualified  applicants  pls  apply
online  at  https://bnymellon.eightfold.ai/careers  &
utilize  ref  code  #57071.  Please  indicate  “referral
source – advertisement –PPG”.


