
NOTICE OF SPECIAL
MEETING

In  accordance  with  the
Sunshine Act, 65 Pa.C.S § 709,
NOTICE is hereby given that a
Hybrid  Special  Meeting  of
Urban  Redevelopment
Authority of Pittsburgh will be
held on July 25, 2024, at 11:00
A.M.,  prevailing time,  and in
person at, 412 (formerly 420)
Boulevard of the Allies, Suite
901, Pittsburgh, Pennsylvania
15219, in the August Wilson
Room  and  virtual  at  which
time  electronic  information
will be provided.
Please note that due to the
limited  seating  capacity  for
in-person  attendance,
registration  is  required.  To
register  for  in-person
attendance or  obtain further
information  on  participating
virtually,  please  visit
https://bit.ly/URABoard
or call 412-255-6600.

Theresa Schacht
Board Secretary


