
INVITATION TO BID
NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that
plans  are  available  for  the
following project:

Citizen Science Lab (636
Herron Ave. Pittsburgh, PA

15219)
Full  sets  of  drawings  &
specifications  may  be
obtained  for  purchase  at  A.
Martini & Co. located at 320
Grant  Street  Verona,  PA
15147,  412-828-5500,
beginning  Thursday  March
28th 2024 or electronic files of
the drawings & specifications
can be  obtained  through A.
Martini  &  Co.  BIDS WILL  BE
RECEIVED  until  2:00PM  on
April 16th at the office of A.
Martini & Co. located at 320
Grant  Street,  Verona,  PA
15147  or  via  EMAIL  to
jdouglass@amartinigc.com. Th
is  project  will  have  RACP
funding.  All  RACP  guidelines
including  Pennsylvania  steel
products  procurement  act,
Trades  practices  act,  Public
works contractor’s bond law
of  1967,  Commonwealth
procurement  code,
Nondiscrimination  clause,  &
PA prevailing wage act (PWA)
need to be followed. If  there
are  additional  questions,
please contact Josh Douglass,
at  A.  Martini  &  Co.,
412-828-5500.


