
PUBLIC  NOTICE  is  hereby
given  that  the  Borough  of
McKees  Rocks  Planning
Commission will hold a public
meeting  on  Monday,  March
11, 2024 beginning 7:00 pm in
the Council Chambers of the
McKees  Rocks  Municipal
building  located  at  340  Bell
Avenue,  McKees  Rocks,
Pennsylvania  15136  for
general  business  purposes,
including review of a pending
Zoning  Ordinance
Amendment  relative  to
administrative  duties  and
powers of the Zoning Board in
alignment to the MPC and to
designate  buildings  used  for
related/incidental storage as a
permitted  accessory  use  in
the C-M District The public is
welcome to attend.

LeeAnn Wozniak, Borough
Manager


