
 
LEGAL  NOTICE  –  The
business  records  of  the
following  customers  of
ACCESS  INFORMATION
MANAGEMENT  (or  any
affiliates of ACCESS) located at
923 Bidwell Street, Pittsburgh,
PA  15233  have  been
abandoned:  THE  ART
INSTITUITE OF PITTSBURGH
and  GOLDEN  EAGLE
CONSTRUCTION  CO..  All
records will  be shredded 16
days after publication of this
notice.  Anyone  claiming  to
have an interest in the records
should  contact  Access
Information  Protected  in
writing  at  the  following
address:  4  First  Avenue,
Peabody,  MA  01960,  Attn:
Legal  Department,  Tel.  No.
(888)  869-2767  (Client
Support);  email:
Collections@accesscorp.com.


