
ROBERT GUY "BOB" PELUSO
On February 15, 2024, after 85 and a half amazing years,

Robert Guy “Bob” Peluso passed away peacefully with his
family by his side. Family and friends know and love Bob as a
son, brother, grandson, husband, dad, Papa, uncle, brother-
in-law, father-in-law, cousin, and friend. Bob was a scholar,
scientist, rescuer, inventor, world traveler, conversationalist,
and  storyteller.  A  Pitt  Panther  fan,  handballer,  bowler,
jokester,  leader,  and  listener.  The  best  Shamoo ride  giver,
winemaker,  foodie,  pasta  maker,  provider,  and  helper.  A
Frank Sinatra aficionado, music lover, and Fox News junkie.
He  was  non-judgemental  and  endlessly  supportive.
Impeccable with his word and generous with his time and
money. A brilliant mind and a fierce heart. He was simply the
best. Bob will be missed by everyone who knew him. Friends
and  family  will  be  received  on  Wednesday,  February  21st
from 2-4 and 6-8 PM in THE HUNTSMAN FUNERAL HOME
AND  CREMATION  SERVICES  OF  MOON  TWP.  (1522
Coraopolis Hts. Rd.) Mass of Christian Burial will take place
on Thursday at 10 AM in St. Margaret Mary Church, Moon
Twp. (everyone please meet at the church) Private interment
will be at Mt. Olivet Catholic Cemetery, Hopewell. In lieu of
flowers,  memorial  contributions  may  be  made  to:  The
Wounded Warrior  Project  www.woundedwarriorproject.org.
www.huntsmanfuneralhomes.com 
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