
EAST ALLEGHENY
SCHOOL DISTRICT –

SEALED BIDS
  The  East  Allegheny  School
District will receive sealed bids
for  Photographic  Services  to
be used by the School District
during the 2024-2027 school
years.   Sealed  bids  must  be
delivered or mailed to arrive at
the  Business  Office  by  2:00
p.m.,  prevailing  time,
Wednesday March 13, 2024,
at  which  time  they  will  be
publicly opened and read. Bids
should  be  mailed  to:  East
Allegheny  School  District,
Attention: Toni Valicenti, 1150
Jacks  Run  Road,  North
Versailles,  PA  15137.   All
information  concerning
specifications  may  be
obtained from Amy Rohal at
412-824-8012  x4150  or
arohal@eawildcats.net.   The
East Allegheny School Board
reserves the right to reject any
and all bids and to make the
award in the best interest of
the School District


