
BOROUGH OF CASTLE
SHANNON

PUBLIC NOTICE
TAKE  NOTICE  that  the
Borough  Council  of  the
Borough of Castle Shannon, at
its  regularly  scheduled
meeting  to  be  held  at  7:00
p.m. on Monday, February 12,
2024, at the Castle Shannon
Municipal  Center,  3310
McRoberts  Road,  Castle
Shannon, PA 15234 will hold a
public  hearing  and  consider
enactment  of  an  ordinance
titled as follows:
AN  ORDINANCE  OF  THE
BOROUGH  OF  CASTLE
SHANNON,  ALLEGHENY
COUNTY,  PENNSYLVNIA,
AMENDING  AND
RESTATING  ORDINANCE
NUMBER 745, KNOWN AS
THE  CASTLE  SHANNON
SOLID WASTE ORDINANCE
REGULATING THE STORAGE,
COLLECTION  AND
DISPOSAL  OF  GARBAGE,
RUBBISH,  AND  REFUSE
AND PROVIDING FOR THE
COLLECTION OF GARBAGE,
RUBBISH,  AND  REFUSE
ONLY  BY  APPROVED
COLLECTORS;  PROVIDING
FOR THE USE OF SPECIFIED
CONTAINERS  FOR  THE
STORAGE AND COLLECTION
OF  GARBAGE,  RUBBISH
AND  REFUSE;  PROVIDING
FOR THE ADMINISTRATION
AND  ENFORCEMENT  OF
THE  ORDINANCE  AND
APPLICABLE REGULATIONS;
AND PROVIDING PENALTIES
FOR VIOLATIONS
The  proposed  ordinance
amends  and  restates  the
Borough’s previously enacted
Solid  Waste  Ordinance  and
establishes requirements and
regulations  for  the  storage,
collection  and  disposal  of
residential and non-residential
solid waste, garbage, rubbish
and  refuse  in  the  Borough,
including  but  not  limited  to,
prohibited  activities,
requirements  for  the  use of
specified  containers,
administration  and
enforcement of the provisions
of the ordinance, penalties for
violations  of  the  ordinance
and establishing an effective
date of the ordinance.
A  copy  of  the  complete
ordinance  is  available  for
review  at  the  office  of  the
Borough  Manager  at  the
above stated address. You are
invited  to  attend  the  public
hearing,  provide  comments
and  participate  in  these
matters.

C. Michael Foote
Borough Manager


