
The Successor Trustee named
below  gives  notice  of  the
death of Dorothy J. Jaquette,
2023 of Forest Hills, PA. Said
Decedent was the Settlor of
the  Dorothy  J.  Jaquette
Revocable Agreement of Trust
dated  July  26,  2018.  The
Successor Trustee request all
persons having claims against
the Decedent and the Trust to
make known to the same in
writing to them or their att.,
and  all  persons  indebted  to
the  Decedent  and  Trust  to
make  payment  to  them
without  delay.  Raymond
Jaquette,  Successor  Trustee,
54  Fawnvue  Dr.,  McKees
Rocks, PA 15136, or to Joseph
S. Bielecki, Esq., 68 South 12th
St., Pittsburgh, PA 15203.


