
Declaration of the Age of
Majority, Minnesota 220

Rule Notice:
All  rights  reserved  re;
Declaration  of  the  Age  of
Majority  LISA  MICHELLE
TURNER©. I  Turner,  Lisa dba
LISA TURNER, am over the age
of 18, and domiciled on the
state, known as Pennsylvania.
I have personal knowledge of
the facts herein, and, if called
as  a  witness,  could  testify
completely  thereto.  I  Turner,
Lisa dba LISA TURNER, suffer
no legal disabilities and have
personal  knowledge  of  the
facts  set  forth  below.  This
Declaration  of  the  Age  of
Majority,  Commonwealth  of
Pennsylvania  Department  of
State,  registration  number
202354773.  I  Turner,
Lisa-Michelle  dba  LISA
MICHELLETURNER, do hereby
notice  all  officials  of  the
following, State of Minnesota
Rule 220.Birth Certificates (The
Registrar of Titles is authorized
to receive for  registration of
memorials  upon  any
outstanding certificate of title
an  official  birth  certificate
pertaining  to  a  registered
owner  named  in  said
certificate of title showing the
date of birth of said registered
owner,  providing  there  is
attached  to  said  birth
certificate a declaration of an
affiant who states that he/she
is  familiar  with  the  facts
recited, stating that the party
named in said birth certificate
is the same party as one of
the  owners  named  in  said
certificate  of  title;  and  that
thereafter  the  Registrar  of
Titles  shall  treat  said
registered  owner  as  having
attained  the  age  of  the
majority  at  a  date  18  years
after the date of birth shown
by said certificate).


