
SHARPSBURG BOROUGH
NOTICE OF PUBLIC

MEETING SCHEDULE FOR
2024

Notice  is  hereby  given  that
Sharpsburg  Borough  Council
will  hold  a  reorganizational
meeting on Tuesday, January
2, 2024. Also, the Borough will
hold  legislative  public
meetings  on  the  fourth
Thursday  of  each  month  in
2024 except in November and
December.  Those  meetings
will  be  November  21  and
December 19.  There will  be
non-legislative meetings held
the second Thursday of each
month. All meetings are held
in  Council  Chambers,  1611
Main Street.

Notice is also given of the
following meeting days/times:
Historical Commission – 1st

Wednesday at 7pm
Parks and Recreation

Commission – 3rd Monday at
6pm

Human Rights Commission -
2nd Tuesday at 7pm in even

months
Planning Commission – 2nd

Thursday at 6pm
Zoning Hearing Board – as

needed
Christine DeRunk, Borough

Manager


