
STATEMENT OF
REGISTRATION

Foreign Business
Corporation

Notice  is  hereby  given  that
VEYTEL,  INC.,  a  foreign
business  corporation,  has
applied for a Statement of
Registration to do business
in  Pennsylvania.  The
corporation is incorporated
under the laws of the State
of  Delaware.  The  address
of its principal office under
the laws of said jurisdiction
is  251  Little  Falls  Drive,
Wilmington, DE 19808, and
the address of its proposed
registered  office  in
Pennsylvania  is  163
Rockwell  Lane,  Pittsburgh,
PA  15218.  The  registered
office  of  the  corporation
shall be deemed for venue
and  official  publication
purposes  to  be  in
Allegheny County.


