
BOROUGH OF
BRENTWOOD

NOTICE OF INTENT TO
ADOPT ORDINANCE NO.

1313
Notice  is  hereby  given  that
Brentwood Borough Council is
considering  the  adoption  of
Ordinance  No.  1313.  Said
ordinance  would  permit  the
placement of one stop sign on
Lawnview Avenue facing west
at  the  intersection  with
Beisner Avenue. A  complete
copy  of  the  text  of  this
ordinance  is  available  for
review  at  the  Brentwood
Municipal  Building  during
regular  business  hours  or
online  at
www.brentwoodboro.com.  It
is anticipated that Council will
consider  formal  adoption  of
this  ordinance  during  its
November 27, 2023 business
meeting.  Such  meeting  will
take place at 7:30PM at the
Brentwood Municipal Building,
which  is  located  at  3735
Brownsville  Road,  Pittsburgh,
PA 15227.


