
Public Auction Notice
To  satisfy  its  statutory  lien
pursuant  to  73  P.S.  1901 et
seq. a public lien sale will be
held on Thursday, November
30, 2023, at 12:00pm at Atlas
Self  Storage,  6449  Saltsburg
Rd, Pittsburgh, PA 15235. The
following spaces will be sold
to satisfy the owner's lien: 133
– Gregory Curry, 263 – David
Knouse,  371  –  Michael
Baldwin,  605 – Barbara Ann
Tucker, 420 – Alana Hayes, 858
– Ashley Brown, 821 – Shauna
Berry,  524,528 –  Paul  Terek,
355 – Jason Taylor, 859 – Sheri
Fehl, 303 – Torri Butler, 853 –
Dorene  Dinnocenzo,  916  –
Chauntel  Hardy,  432  –
Anthony Divito. The contents
of each storage space will be
sold at the time of the auction
and payment is to be cash or
credit  card  only.  Owner
reserves  the  right  to  bid  at
Public Sale,  reject any or all
bids,  and  cancel  or  adjourn
the sale. For inquires on the
sale please call the office at
(412) 795-5353 (M-F 9-5, Sat
9-4).


