
NOTICE OF
INCORPORATION

Hayley  Haldeman,  Esq.,
Dentons Cohen & Grigsby P.C.,
625  Liberty  Avenue,
Pittsburgh,  PA  15222-3152:
Notice  is  hereby  given  that
Articles of Incorporation were
filed with the Department of
State of the Commonwealth
of  Pennsylvania,  on  October
18,  2023  with  respect  to  a
proposed  nonprofit
corporation,  10B Foundation,
which has been incorporated
under  the  Nonprofit
Corporation  Law of  1988.  A
brief summary of the purpose
or  purposes  for  which  said
corporation  is  organized  is:
exclusively  charitable,
scientific,  literary  and
educational within the scope
of  Section  501(c)(3)  of  the
Internal  Revenue  Code  of
1986, as amended.


