
NOTICE OF PUBLIC
DISPLAY AND ACTION OF

2024 BUDGET
Notice is hereby given that the
Sharpsburg  Borough  Council
has  completed  a  proposed
2024 budget  which shall  be
available for inspection by the
public  online  at
www.sharpsburgborough.co
m or in the office located at
1611 Main St., Pittsburgh, PA
15215, for a period of 10 days
beginning November 6, 2023.
Notice  is  hereby  also  given
that Borough Council intends
to maintain by resolution the
current tax levy rate of 9.25
mills  for  general  property
taxes and 0.5 mills for the fire
tax for a total of 9.75 mills.
Borough  Council  intends  to
consider  adoption  of  the
budget  and  proposed
resolution together  with  any
and  all  other  business  and
may come before Council at
its regular meeting scheduled
for  November  16,  2023  at
6:30pm in Council Chambers,
1611 Main St. The meeting will
be  both  in  person  and  on
Zoom. The Zoom link can be
found on the Borough website
at
www.sharpsburgborough.co
m.

Christine DeRunk,
Borough Manager


