
The Pittsburgh Water and
Sewer Authority
Advertisement

Invitation for Bids (IFB)
ASPINWALL PUMP STATION
CONCRETE FLOOR REPAIR

PWSA Project No.
2017-323-104-1

Pre-Bid Meeting: October 24,
2023 at 1:00 p.m. both on MS
Teams  and  in  person  at
Aspinwall  Water  Treatment
Plant,  900  Freeport  Road,
Pittsburgh,  PA  15238.  The
non-mandatory  meeting  will
be followed by a site visit to
the  pump  station  for  those
attending in person.
Vendor  Questions  Due:
November  1,  2023  by  4:00
p.m.
Bids Due: November 9, 2023
by 1:00 p.m.
PWSA is  requesting bids  for
concrete  floor  repair  in  the
Aspinwall Pump Station at the
Aspinwall  Water  Treatment
Plant. Repairs to the existing
reinforced concrete floor will
include removal and repair of
spalled  concrete  areas  and
crack  repairs;  saw-cutting;
surface preparation;  cleaning
steel  reinforcement;  new
materials  placement;  and
surface finishing.
For details and to submit a bid,
visit:
https://pgh2o.bonfirehub.com
/opportunities/109346


