
NOTICE – BOROUGH OF
ROSSLYN FARMS

The Council of the Borough of
Rosslyn  Farms  will  hold  a
public meeting to consider the
adoption  of  an  Ordinance
establishing requirements for
the  installation,  repair,
replacement  and
maintenance  of  sidewalks,
said  meeting  to  be held  on
October 9, 2023 at 7:00 p.m.
at Rosslyn Farms Community
Center,  400  Kings  Highway,
Carnegie, PA 15106, at which
time  all  interested  persons
may attend and be heard.

TITLE
An ordinance of the Borough
of Rosslyn Farms, County of
Allegheny, Commonwealth of
Pennsylvania,  amending
Chapter 158 of the Borough
Code  of  Ordinances,  Streets
and Sidewalks, to provide for
the  installation  of  new
sidewalks,  establish  certain
criteria  related  to  new  and
existing  sidewalk
construction,  repair,  and
maintenance,  provide  for
penalties  for  violations,  and
authorize  the  filing  of  liens
against  properties  for  work
done by the Borough

SUMMARY
The  proposed  ordinance
would  impose  requirements
for  installing  new  sidewalks,
the repair,  replacement,  and
reconstruction  of  existing
sidewalks,  and  sidewalk
maintenance;  authorize  the
filing  of  liens  against
properties where the Borough
performs  required  sidewalk
repairs;  and  establish
penalties for  violation of  the
ordinance  requirements.   A
copy  of  the  proposed
Ordinance may be examined
in the Borough office, without
charge,  or  obtained  for  a
charge not  greater  than the
cost  thereof,  during  regular
business hours.

Dorothy Falk, Borough
Secretary


