
PUBLIC NOTICE
The South Hills Area Council of
Governments  (SHACOG)
Franchising  Authority  Board
will hold a special meeting at
6:30  p.m.  on  Tuesday,
September  19,  2023,  in  the
Community  Room  of  the
Whitehall  Borough  Municipal
Building,  100  Borough  Park
Drive, Pittsburgh, PA 15236, to
consider  the  renewal  of  a
cable  franchise  agreement
between  SHACOG  and
Verizon. During that meeting a
hearing will be conducted to
review the proposed franchise
agreement.  The  following
municipalities are governed by
the  SHACOG  Franchising
Authority:
Baldwin Borough
Baldwin Township
Brentwood Borough
Castle Shannon Borough
Dormont Borough
Elizabeth Township
Heidelberg Borough
Jefferson Hills Borough
Mt. Oliver Borough
Scott Township
White Oak Borough
Whitehall Borough
After the public hearing formal
approval of the agreement will
be considered. The proposed
agreement  is  available  for
public review at the SHACOG
office  or  in  the  respective
municipalities.  Public
testimony  concerning  the
proposed agreement  will  be
received  during  the  hearing
and  written  comments
submitted  at  or  before  the
public  hearing  will  be
reviewed. Written comments
should  be  sent  to  Stanley
Louis  Gorski,  Executive
Director,  SHACOG,  2600  Old
Greentree Road, Carnegie, PA
15106.  Other  Franchising
Authority  administrative
matters  will  also  be
considered at the meeting.

Stanley Louis Gorski
Executive Director


