
PENNSYLVANIA PUBLIC
UTILITY COMMISSION

Application of  Columbia  Gas
of  Pennsylvania,  Inc.  for
approval of the Acquisition by
Purchase  of  Real  Property
known as 4000 Energy Drive,
Bridgeville,  PA.  Docket
Number: A-2023-3042048
Formal protests and petitions
to intervene must be filed in
accordance  with  Title  52  of
the Pennsylvania Code, on or
before  Tuesday,  September
*5, 2023. All  filings must be
made with  the  Secretary  of
the Pennsylvania Public Utility
Commission  at  the  mailing
address of 400 North Street,
2nd  Floor,  Harrisburg,  PA
17120,  OR  on  the
Commission’s  website  at
www.puc.pa.gov, with a copy
served on the Applicant. The
documents filed in support of
the  Application  are  available
for inspection and copying at
the  Office  of  the  Secretary
between  the  hours  of  8:00
a.m.  and 4:30  p.m.  Monday
through  Friday,  on  the
Commission’s  website  at
www.puc.pa.gov,  and  at  the
Applicant’s business address.
If a filing contains confidential
or  proprietary  material,  the
filing  is  required  to  be
submitted  by  overnight
delivery.

Applicant:
Columbia Gas of Pa, Inc.
Through and By Counsel:

Theodore J. Gallagher, Esquire
(ID # 90842)

121 Champion Way, Suite 100
Canonsburg, PA 15317

tjgallagher@nisource.com
AND

Candis A. Tunilo, Esquire (ID
#89891)

800 N Third Street, Suite 204
Harrisburg, PA 17102
ctunilo@nisource.com

BY THE COMMISSION
 Rosemary Chiavetta

Secretary


