
IT:  The  Bank  of  New  York  Mellon  seeks  Lead  Mgr,
Production  Srvcs  in  Pittsburgh,  PA,  to  perform  w/i
Production  Srvcs  function  involved  w/  planning,
analysis, delivery, & integration of sys’s & bus. dvlpmt
projects.  Bachelor’s,  or  foreign  equiv,  in  CS,  Comp
Eng’g,  Electronic  Eng’g  or  rel  field,  &  8  yrs
progressively  responsible  exp  in  job  offered  or  rel
occupation. 8 yrs progressively responsible exp must
incl:  Supporting  multi-currency,  multi  branch,  multi
entity  processing  for  demand  deposit  acctg
functionality for cash accts held on behalf of custody,
cash  clearing,  not-in-bank  (outsourcing  clients),  &
other  clients;  Utilizing  trade  processing  functionality
for  foreign  exchange  &  money  mrkts  incl  deposits,
placements,  loans,  CD’s,  &  cash  mgmt  features  incl
Zero  Balance  Acctg,  Overdraft  Netting,  Late  Night
Investment,  Global  Late  Night  Investment  &  SWIFT
receipt  &  delivery  of  customer  info.  Remote  work
permitted w/i commutable distance from worksite. Pls
apply at https://bnymellon.eightfold.ai/careers & utilize
ref  code  #38908.  Pls  indicate  “referral  source  –
advertisement – PPG.”


